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1. ED-CELL - National Science & Technology 

Entrepreneurship Development Board (NSTEDB), 

Department of Science and Technology, Government of 

India, New Delhi. 

2. PMUSD-2i33/202 1 -PMUSD "Hunar Se Rozgar Tak" 

(HSRT) 

3. Utility Certificate for PMUSD-2i33/202 1 -PMUSD "Hunar 

Se Rozgar Tak" (HSRT) 
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Dr.N.R.Saravanan Chandra <sarannr@gmail.com>

Fwd: 1st Installment of Programme/s Sanctioned under DST–NIMAT Project 2019-20

1 message

arun arshitha <arunarshmba86@gmail.com> Tue, Jul 12, 2022 at 1:20 PM
To: sarannr@gmail.com

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Adarsh Mittal <aadi.dj4u@gmail.com>

Date: Tue 12 Jul, 2022, 1:02 PM

Subject: Fwd: 1st Installment of Programme/s Sanctioned under DST–NIMAT Project 2019-20

To: arun arshitha <arunarshmba86@gmail.com>


---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: ponram manickavasugi <spmanickavasugi@gmail.com>

Date: Fri, Oct 11, 2019 at 12:34 PM

Subject: Fwd: 1st Installment of Programme/s Sanctioned under DST–NIMAT Project 2019-20

To: Adarsh mittal <aadi.dj4u@gmail.com>


---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Prakash Solanki <psolanki@ediindia.org>

Date: Mon, 7 Oct 2019, 3:39 pm

Subject: 1st Installment of Programme/s Sanctioned under DST–NIMAT Project 2019-20

To: <spmanickavasugi@gmail.com>, <aadi.dj4u@gmail.com>, <acasdmn@gmail.com>, <annaicollege@rediffmail.com>


Dr. Manickavasugi S. P.
Principal
Annai College of Arts and Science
Anakudi Road,
Kovilacheri
Kumbakonam - 612 001
Tamil Nadu
 
Kind Attention:
Prof. Adarsh Mittal A., Assistant Professor
 
Dear Sir,
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Sub:
1st Installment of Programme/s Sanctioned under DST–NIMAT Project
2019-20

 
This is with reference to the Agreement signed between
EDII and your organization for conducting programme(s) under DST-NIMAT Project
2019-20 to create techno-entrepreneurs and resource persons through
Entrepreneurship Development Programme Agency.
 
As per the Agreement, 80% of the sanctioned amount per
programme is to be released before commencement of the programme(s). Accordingly,
Rs. 32000/-
has been credited in your bank account on 26/09/2019.
The detailed brake-up of the total amount is as following:
 

Sr.
No.

Programme
/
Activity

No.
of
Programme
Sanctioned

1st
Installment per
Programme (Rs.)

Total
Amount of the
Programme (Rs.)

1 EAC 2 16000/- 32000/-
Total 32000/-

 
You are requested to
please send us the receipt for the same.  
 
Thanking you, with regards
 
Yours sincerely,

-- 

Prakash Solanki

Faculty & National Project Coordinator

Entrepreneurship Development Institute of India,

Village: Bhat, Via Indira Bridge, Dist. Gandhinagar (Gujarat) INDIA. 382 428

M: 097 2381 6384
Ph. 91-79-23969161, 23969163

Fax. 91-79-23969164

Disclaimer:
This e-mail and its attachment/s, if any, may contain official information from
EDII. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender
immediately and delete this e-mail. Any dissemination
or use of this
information by a person other than the intended recipient is unauthorised. The
responsibility lies with the recipient to check this email and any attachment
from the presence of viruses.

Think
before you print, “File this email in an email folder and save a tree.” Go Green…

-- 

Adarsh Mittal A

Head-Trainer
JAI HO ACADEMY,
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Hand phone: +91 98 43 75 09 57 / +91 80 15 47 94 92
      Website:  www.jaihoacademy.com

http://www.jaihoacademy.com/




PMUSD-2i33/202 1 -PMUSD
GOVERNMENT OF INDIA
MINISTRY OF TOTIRISM

7th Floor, East Wing,
Chandralok Building,

Janpath Road
New Delhi- 110001

Dated: 08llll202l
To
The Pay & Accounts Office,
Ministry of Tourism,
New Delhi.

Subject: Central Financial Assistance of Rs. 5,48,550/- (Rupees Five Lakhs Forty
Eight Thousand Five Hundred and Fifty only) to KKO Mohamed Ibrahim Educational
and Charitable Trust empanelled as Annai College of Arts & Science, Kovilacheri,
Kumbakonam for conducting HSRT programme for 120 candidates as 307o of base cost
inFY2020-21.

Sir,

I am directed to convey the sanction of the President of India to release Rs. 5,48,550/-
(Rupees Five Lakhs Forty Eight Thousand Five Hundred and Fifty only) to KKO Mohamed
Ibrahim Educational and Charitable Trust empanelled as Annai College of Arts & Science,

Kovilacheri, Kumbakonam for conducting HSRT Progarmme for 120 trainees- an initiative of
this Ministry during FY 2020-21. This amount forms 30% of the base cost for 120 trainees.

2. The payment would be made through electronic transfer of funds in favour of the KKO
Mohamed Ibrahim Educational and Charitable Trust, Account No. 004120000068459, IFS
Code: CIUB0000004 in City Union Bank by Pay & Accounts Officer, Ministry of Tourism on
presentation of the bill by the Drawing & Disbursing Officer.

3. The grant of Rs. Rs. 5,48,550/- (Rupees Five Lakhs Forty Eight Thousand Five Hundred
and Fifty only) is being released as advance and utilization certificate v6ill be furnished by the

institute while claiming the complete reimbursement.

4. Since it is the first grant which is being released, no UC is pending in respect of grants-
in -aid released to the Institute in respect of Capacity Building for Service Providers Scheme
(CBSP) of this Ministry.

5. In terms of rule 209(l) of GFR the Grantee Institute has furnished a certificate to the
effect that it has not obtained/applied for the grants for the same purpose or activify from any
other Ministry/Department, Government of India or State Government.

6. The Grantee Institute is required to maintain subsidiary accounts of the Government
grant and furnish to the Accounts Officer a set of audited Statement of accounts after utilization
of Grants in aid or whenever called for.

8. Entries have been made in the Grant-in-Aid register at S.No.40 for the year 2021-22.
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9. In terms of rule 211(l) of GFR the accounts of grantee Institution /organisation shall be
open to the inspection by the sanctioning authority and audit, both by the Comptroller and
Auditor- General of India under the provision of CAG (DPC) act l97l and internal audit by the
Principal Accounts Office of the Ministry of Department, whenever the Institution or
organisation is called upon to do so.

10' The expenditure will be debitabte to Demand No.98-Tourism, 3452-Tourism (Major
Head), 8O-General (Sub Major Head), 80.003-Training (Minor Head), 08-Capacity Building lor
Service Providers, 08.00.31-Grants-in-aid-General for the year 2021-2OZZ (plin). Code No.
3452-80.003-08.00.3 1 (Plan).

ll. This issues with the concurrence of Integrated Finance vide U.O. no. 150 dated
01.lt.202t.

Yours faithfully

(Surendra Kumar)
Under Sec retary to1$ $qyf psf,dlpfikdiamn):- - tJ 

sr;i ilkq/unoerseoerary
Admn. II (Cash), MOT, with the original sanction letter. (2 copiesll n 4a1-6qTuinstryol-[ounsm

chief Financial controller, Ministry of civil Aviation & Tourism, D6iftm{f;ilJ:,11"
IF Division, MOT, Transport Bhawan, New Delhi.
O/o Pr. Director of Audit, (E&SM), AGCR Building,
Principal, Pay & Accounts Office, Rajiv Gandhi
Aurobindo Marg, New Delhi-l10003.
B & A Section, Chanderlok Building, New Dethi.
The Principal, KKO Mohamed Ibrahim Educational and Charitable Trust,
Kumbakonam. a

The Regional Director, India tourism, South.
Guard file

-f*
(Surendra Kumar)

Under Secretary to the Government of India

IP Estate, New Delhi - I10002.
Bhawan, Safdarjung Airport, Sri

T+ro:n5,r3m;,uo*eq c'r lf;fliru,/Minrstry 
of lourism

TffiiffI#F-



 



 

 

 

 


